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About the Editors.....
Dr. Abhishek Rajpurohit is contributing to the intellectual tapestry of Entomology and 
Zoology fields for nearly two decades. Dr. Rajpurohit earned his doctorate from Jai 
Narain Vyas University, Jodhpur, Rajasthan in 2005. His expertise is particularly evident 
in his extensive body of research, including numerous contributions to international and 
national journals, as well as presentations at prestigious conferences, seminars, and 
workshops. Currently four dedicated research scholars are pursuing their Ph.D. under 
his insightful mentorship. Dr. Rajpurohit presently serves as an Assistant Professor in the 
Department of Life Sciences and also holds the position of Assistant Examination 
Controller and Science Coordinator for Training &Placement Office at Lachoo Memorial 
College of Science and Technology, Jodhpur. He is also life member of the Indian 
Science Congress.

Dr. Ubaid Akram Farooqui is a senior professor and Head of the Department of English 
at BSR Government Arts College in Alwar, Rajasthan, with over twenty-eight years of 
experience in Higher Education. Passionate about learning and teaching English 
Language & Literature, he has authored and edited 12 books and contributed to 
university and college magazines. He actively participated in numerous seminars, 
conferences, FDPs and workshops, and his over thirty papers got published in national 
and international journals. Recognized for his academic achievements, he has received 
the Best Scholar Awards from AMU Aligarh. He is a dedicated life member of INSPIRA, 
RASE and other academic associations. Dr. Farooqui's research interests span various 
fields, including Applied Linguistics, ELT, American & British Literature, Women's 
Writings, Urdu Literature, Film Studies, and Indian Literature.

Dr. Narendra Kumar Sharma is currently working as an Assistant Professor & Head, 
Department of Chemistry, VMPG College, Karauli, Rajasthan. He has done M.Sc. in 
Inorganic Chemistry from Jiwaji University Gwalior M.P. & M.Phil. in year 2009 from 
Global University Nagaland. He was awarded Ph.D. in 2016 from Jiwaji University, 
Gwalior, M.P. He has 15 years of teaching experience in UG and 05 years in PG. Dr. 
Sharma has published more than eighteen research papers in National and International 
reputed Journals. He participated and presented papers in various National/International 
Conferences/Seminar/Workshop. He has also published five chapter in edited books. He 
is the life member of International Journal of Scientific Research and Growth & 
International Journal of Innovative Research and Growth.
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